Re: South Park Cash Disbursements

Subject: Re: South Park Cash Disbursements

From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>

Date: 08/22/2018 11:24 AM

To: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>, Marcus Lieber
<marcus.lieber@armaninollp.com>

Paid. Thanks!

From: Robert Buente <bbuente@l0l0dev.org>

Date: Wednesday, August 22, 2018 at 10:33 AM

To: Marcus Lieber <marcus.lieber@armaninollp.com>, Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>
Subject: Re: South Park Cash Disbursements

Done

Get Outlook for i0S <https://aka.ms/oQukef>

From: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 22, 2018 10:30:25 AM

To: Robert Buente; Ellen Riotto

Subject: South Park Cash Disbursements

Hi Bob,

The current SP check run, is ready for your approval.

Thanks,

Marcus Lieber
Manager
Business Management & Family Office Services

ArmaninoLLP <http://http/armaninollp.com>
11766 Wilshire Blvd., Ninth Floor | Los Angeles, CA 90025
(310) 478-4148 x5794 main | (310) 703-1227 fax
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Re: South Park Cash Disbursements

This communication, including attachments, is for the exclusive use of the person or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential, proprietary and/or
privileged information. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or
taking of any action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than

the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this by mistake, please contact the
sender immediately.
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